
Warre n Farrell , noted human libe ration ist, spoke on Monday
during activities commemoratin g Human Lib Week. Farrell
discussed the effects of Women 's lib on men.

(Photo by D. Maresh)

A full-time carnival at-
mosphere in the Kehr Union will
greet returning alumni and the
brothers , sisters and parents of
students participating in
Siblings Weekend on campus.
The carnival will feature some
27 fun games and food
specialties , sponsored by
various campus organizations .
The carnival will be in
operation two days , today and
tomorr ow, from 1 p.m. to 1 a.m.
both days. The public is cor-
dially invited to participa te in
the act ivit ies.

Food concessions will include
such popular items as soft
pretzel s , potato pancakes ,
funnel cakes , perogies , french
fr ies, cake , rock cand ies,

popcorn and root beer.
Games and contests will

include peanut throw , water
tank dunk , cake walk , darts ,
balloon shaving, fortune telling,
bowling pin and silver dollar
game, nickel pitch , golf game ,
popcorn and ball throw . In
addition , there will be car toons
shown in the Coffee House,
periodic performances of the
play "Indians " by the
Bloomsbur g Players , a western
jail , white elephan t sale, a book
table conta ining free literature
and a car wreck outside the
union building.

All of the above activ ities are
sponsored by the var ious
college organ izat ions as either
serv ice projects or fund raisers.

Carnival in Kehr

By PEGGY MORAN
Allocations to the Student

Speech and Hearing
Association, the Alice Lloyd
program and the approval, of
student members on the
Campus Judicial Board were
among the topics discussed at
the Monday, April 22 meeting of
the CGA held in the Multipur-
pose Room in the Union.

Funds amounting to $400.00
were given to the Student
Speech and Hearing Association
to help send BSC students to the
state convention . The con-
vention will be held May 4-5 in
the Poconos.
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allocated to the Alice Lloyd
program. This is a program by
which BSC students may study
rural education in the Ap-
plachians during the summer
break. The course is offered at
Alice Lloyd College in Ken-
tucky. The program runs from
late May through June and the
money will mainly cover travel
expenses.

The following students were
approved by the CGA for the

Another Ho-hum CGA Meeting

Alumni Day at Bloomsbur g
State College will be held this
Saturday, April 27, 1974, ac-
cording to Millard Ludwig ,
President of the BSC Alumni
A mhaaIa ^Iam

Approximate ly a dozen elass
reunions are scheduled and
festivities will get underway
Friday , April 20, 1974 when the
Class of 1924 will be honored
guests of the Alumni
Association at a dinner in
Scranton Commons, while the
Class of 1919 will meet in the
Alumni Room of Waller Hall.

An informal get-together for
all alumni and facu lty will take
place Saturday morning from
9:30 a.m. to 11:30 a.m. in the
formal lounge of the Kehr

College Union . From 10 a.m.
campus tours will be conducted ,
with guides and tr ansportation

available at the Kehr Union
information desk.

At 12:30 p.m., a luncheon for
all alum ni will be held in the
Scranton Commons. During the
annual business meeting im-
mediatel y following the lun-
cheon , at 1:30 p.m, in the
Scranton Commons , the Alumni
Association will present a
Distinguish ed Service Award to
two BSC alumni. The recipients
of this award will be announced
at tha t time."1

Class meetings will begin at
3:00 p.m. which will be followed
by social hours and dinners as
scheduled by reunion classes.
Alumni members may also
enjoy the "Spring Carnival "
which will be in progress in the
Kehr Union Building from 1:00
p.m. to 1:00 a.m. Friday and
Saturday.

Alumni Day Saturday

Campus Judicial Board : Harry
Lumadue, John Roehrig, Sue
Werner, Robert Shelly, Nico
Antoniades, Phillip Romello,
Richard Neuschwander, Sharon
Young, Patti Parsons, Cynthia
Hertzog, Nancy Schaeffer and
Claudia Whittaker.

From these people , two
alternates will be chosen. The
board hears cases involving
students from more than one
residence hall or off campus.

A sum of $200.00 was also
allocated to the physical
educat ion department to pur-
chase awards for the Swim
team State Champions.

Tfie awards include a watch

The 21st annual spring con-
ference of the Pennsylvania
Council for Geography
Education will be held at the
Sheraton Motor Inn, Danville,
Pennsylvania, this Friday and
Saturday, April 26 and 27.
Bloomsburg State College is
serving as the host institution
and the theme of the conference
is "All Possible Worlds."

During the Friday evening
banquet, Dr. Lee C. Hopple,
Bloomsburg State College, who
is President of the Council, will
preside. Greetings will be ex-
tended by Dr. James H. Mc-
Cormick, BSC President, and
the main address entitled , "The
Interplay of Percepts and
Concepts in the Teaching of
Geography", will be given by
Dr. Preston E. James, Maxwell
Emeritus ¦ Professor of
G e o g r a p h y ,  Sy racuse

c University.
Session one on Friday evening

will cover a sem inar an d
discussion on geographical
thought. The two sessions

Saturday will cover general
topics and geography
education. During the luncheon
at 12:00 noon on Saturday ,
election of officers and direc-
tors for the 1974-75 college year
will be held. In addition, the
PCGE Distinguished Service
Award will be presented to Dr.
Bruce E. Adams, Bloomsburg
State College. The activities will
conclude Saturday afternoon
with two field trips: a physical
geography field trip covering
the areas north of Bloomsburg
State College, south near
Frackville , the Conyngham
Valley and Nescopeck Creek
Water Gap;' and an industrial
field trip through the Danville
plant of Kennedy Van Saun.

The main goal of the Penn-
sylvania Council for Geography
Educat ion is the advancement
of geographical education in
public schools and colleges ;n
Pennsylvania Public School
geography teachers and college
professors will be in attendance
this weekend.

PCGA Spring Conference

for Rich Kozicki, and blazers
for Stu Marvin, Dave Slade and
Paul Richards.

The revised CGA constitution
was brought up for discussion
and final approval was post-
poned until the May 6 meeting
due to some minor revisions,
some of which were the addition
of recreation , judicial and ticket
committees.

J. Douglas Dowes, Executive
Secretary of the Com-
monwealth Association of
Students will speak at the next
CGA meeting on May 6, At that
meeting next year's officers
will officially be sworn in for
their term.

Spring is here and once again
the Greeks at BSC are anxiously
anticipating the arrival of
Greek Week festivities. Greek
Week will begin on Sunday,
April 28 starting with the Road-
Rally at 2:00. In the evening, all
Greeks will meet at 7:00 in
Carver Hall alpng with the rest
of the campus to participate in
the popular Greek Sing. The
theme for this year's Greek
Sing is Music of the 60's. At this
time, Greek man and Greek
woman for 1974 will be
presente d to the Cam pus
Community, along with the
In t e r -So ro r i t y  Counci l
scholarship award winners, a
sur pr ise added attrac t ion is also
planned.

On Monday, April 29 at 5:30,
spectators will witness the
grea t display of stren gth as the
Greeks struggle to become Tug
of War Cham ps.

In the Union, on Tuesda y,
April 30 at 1:00, the Pie Eatin g
Contest will be held between the
fra ternities. Game Night will
commence at 7:30 p.m. in
Centennial Gymnasium on
Wednesday May 1. Don't miss
the Greeks in action , pushing
wheelbarrows , eggs and
peanuts and even exchanging
clothes !

Chariot races will be held on
Thursday, May 2, starting at
6: 30 near the tennis courts , with
a course that will prove to be a
challenge for all! Frida y, May 3
is designated as an open day for
nil

Saturday , May 4, beginning at
10:00 a.m. Olympic Day will be
held. At the conclusion of the
events for the day , Greek Week
Champa will be announced by
the co-chairmen of the Greek
Week Committee , Mar gie
Mashett from Tri-Sigma and
Jay Bertsch from Delta Pi.

Greek Week

Students at colleges and high
schools across Ameri ca are
organizing the FAST TO SAVE
A PEOPLE on Wednesd ay, May
1. Co-sponsored by Oxfam-
America and Project Relief , the
FAST is aimed at helping the
six to ten million people who
face death from starvat ion as a
result of the ongoing African
drought , which Ms been called
"the worst ecological disaster
of the century ."

The FAST Unites a massive
fund-raising effort with an
attem pt to develop awareness
of both the crisis situation in
sub-Saharan . Africa and im-
pending food shortages in other
parts of the world.

On May 1, students are urged
to skip one or all of the day 's
meals and to donate the money
thus saved to help the people of
the droug ht-stricken area.
Students will also solicit
financial sponsors to un-
derwrite their fast. Funds
raised in this way will be used
immediately for food, family

plann ing and med ical
assistance.

Funds will also be caref ully
channele d into such long-rang e
projects as agricultural
training program s, well drilling
and wat er resource
m a n a g e m e n t , c r e d i t
cooperatives to aid small far-
mers in the purch ase of seeds,
fertil izers and insecticides ; in
short , to help build the kind of
sound and sustainable
agriculture so ur gently needed
in these developin g nations.

For information , write to
Bruce W. Roberts , Director ;

Project Relief , Inc ; PO Box
1455 ; 335 Westminster Street;
Providence , R.I. 02901 ; or
phone (401) 751-9300.

Fast to Save Peop le



One of the experime nta l animals of the Psychology Department
and some of the sophist ica ted electron ic gadgetry used to monitor
its respons es. (Photo by D. Mar esh)

By MARY DE FELIPPIS
Wall y sits alone, woe-

begotten , as Gertrude coos little
nothings in his ear. No, this is
not the beginning of yet anoth er
Soap opera — it is the Animal
Psychology Lab in Old Science.

Wally is an albino rat; Ger- '
trade , a pigeon . They are owned
by Experimental Psychology
sjudents who try them out
separatel y in various ex-
periments.

Wally, for example , learns
how to go to the bar to get a
drink (of water ). According to
his owner Nancy Hall , Wally is
water-dep rived all day until she
comes to get him for an ex-
perim ent. He is taken from his
cage in the animal lab acros s
the hall to the experimental lab.
Here WaJly is placed in a
specially controlled booth
(Skinner box) where electroni c
equipmen t is rigged for
wha tever ex per imen t the
student and Wally are work ing
on.

Wally learns by the process of
"shaping behavior" ; that is, asystem of rewards and punish-
ments for tasks well done. The
purpo se is to see how the
proce ss of learning tak es place .

Under CRF (Continuous
Reinforcement ) Wally learns
that every time he presses the
bar he will get some water .
Being water-deprive d all day,
Wally is highly motiva ted to
relieve his thirst and so learns
quickl y.

The next experiment however
might be a fixed interval test
that gives Wally a drink every

"thirty seconds no matter how
many times he bar-presses . Or ,
'maybe it's a discrim ina tion test
in which he only gets a drink if
he presses the bar when the
booth light is on.

"Wally is doing very well and
learning much" , stated Nancy.
According to the electronic
counters of the booth Wally has
gone from 80 to 1600 bar presses
per hour , quite an ac-
complishmen t for a ra t.

"However , " Nancy noted ,
"Sometimes when we begin a
new experiment , he show s signs
of frustration when he can 't get i
a dr ink. " As you watch his
behavior , you can almost here I
him mutter , "What the hell's |
the matter with this thing? Why
me?"

Sound familiar? A student is I
not alone in his frustra tion of
learn ing: J ust ask Wally.

GoingTo TheBar

By VALERY O' CONNELL
Waste not , wan t not . For thine

meal ticket might just stay at
the same price .

ARA services will initiate a
Food Ecology Program ,
beginning on Monday, April 29.
The whole idea is to make all
eaters aware of the amount of
food thrown away each day at
the Commons.

"The program was designed
as an attempt to prevent the
need for a rise in board costs
and also to maintain good
quality food service ," state
coordinators Mrs. Barbara
Schaeffer and Mr. Frank
O'Brien , manager of the
Commons. Introduced Monda y
evening, April 22, at the Dining
Room Committee meeting, the
agenda was given unanimous
approval by the student
representatives .
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Waste Not, Want Not
Ecology Program Begins

Interplay with the outside and
with other institut ions is an
imperative aspect of the con-
tinuation and growth of the high
level of intellectual activity of
Bloomsburg State College. The
insurgence of new ideas and
stimulation of partici pation are
a necessary force in the
dynamics of a good school. That
this spirit of involvement
permeates this campus is in a
large part due to the leadership
of a fine and concerned faculty.
Some examples of how the spiri t
is manifested at Bloom fol low.

Dr. James D. Bryden , Jr. ,
Chairman of the Departmen t of
Communication Disorde rs , and
JAr. G. Donald Miller , instructor
of audiology , returned to
Bloomsburg April 6 after a two
week stay in Bahia , Brazil
helping to upgrade the training
of teachers of exceptional
children. While in Bra zil, they
conducted a speech and hearin g
seminar for more than fifty
teachers of children with
communication disorders. In

addition , an excnange program ,
was established betw een
Bloomsburg State College and
Bahia 's Federal Universit y and
Catholic University in the
special education of exceptional
children.

Dr. Marga ret M. Sponseller ,
Director of the Reading Clinic
at Bloomsburg , is servin g in the
17 member state advisory
council for the Righ t to Rea d
program. Right to Read is a
federally funded , nationwide
effort to give all citizens -
children and adults - the basic
reading skills they need. It is
operated by school distri cts in
school buildings , Right to Rea d
centers and homes .

Dr. Percival R. Roberts , III ,
Chairman of the Department of
Art has been notified of his
inclusion in the 1974 edition of
".Contem pora ry Authors ", an
i n t e r n a t i o n a l  B i o -
Bibliographical Guide to
current authors , and the ir
works. Dr. Roberts , who has
written five books of poetr y, Is

also an active partici pant in
admin istration of the Penn-
sylvania Poetry Society. He is a
frequen t judge and speaker for
the National Federation of State
Poetry Societies. During the
summer of 1972, Dr. Roberts
served as Fine Arts Consultant
for the Federal Government
and assisted in the compilation
of an inventory of federally
supported works of art located
in this region.

Dr. William S. O'Bruba ,
Assistant Professor , Depart-
ment of Elementary Education
has recently had two articles
published. "Kinesthetic Ac-
tivities for Prim ary Children
with Reading Difficulties ",
dealing with practical
techniques for dealing with
youngsters suffering from
reading difficulties was
published in READING IM-
PROVEMENT. "Discoverin g
Neighborhood Animal Life "
concernin g pre-science ex-
perien ces for children of nur-
sery age, was published In
ELEMENTARY IDEAS AND
MATERIALS WOR KSHOP.

The Fa culty

They Not Only Have It
They Use It

* bread costs 1.6 cents. He does
not realize that a glass of milk ,
thrown away, is 8.2 cents down
the drai n.

Next week's campaign is
intended to make the average
studen t aware of these wastage ,
problems and hopes to.cut down
in these same areas.

The rising costs and recent
shdrta ges of certa in food items
have produc ed many problems
at eatin g estab lishments
throughout the country. Thus
the plan of the Food Ecology
Program , accor ding to Mrs.
Schaeffer , is to "awaken the
student body to the real
problem here an on all college
ramnuses todav. "

Take and Eat
Eye-catchin g posters will be

placed at strate gic locations in
the Commons , reminding
students to "Take all you want ,
eat all you tak e." Small card-
board reminders , fixed at
various j spots , will urge people
to eat their plates clean. Line
servers will be adorned with
buttons stress ing "If you want
less, tell me."

Behavior Mod Techniques
The program plan includes

four impact campaigns. The
posters will be displayed for two
weeks and then removed.
Following scientific principles
of behavio r modification ,
several weeks later another
emphasis on food wastage will
be put into effect.

"Thus the program is
designed with periods of con-
scious effort and periods of
unconscious practice , con-
cerning the principles taught by
the campain g, " commented
Mrs. Schaeffer.

All eaters (and thus the whole
college community) are en-

(please turn to page three )

BSC Pilot School
Selected as the pilot school for

the entire ARA compan y,
Bloomsbur g State will be the
first to implement this
program. If successful , similar
campai gns will be incorpora ted
next year into the dining ser-
vices of other institutions.

Earlier this school year the
novel pro gram was designed
and launc hed at several Mid
West colleges, under the
sponsors hip of Coca-Cola , USA.
Food wastage at Michigan State
Universit y was discovered to
excede four tons per day. After
the Food Ecology Pro gram was
introduced to the campus ,
wastage was cut down con-
siderably .

Wasted Food Costs
The avera ge BSC stude nt is

not aware that a wasted piece of

j attentIon facult yT "™l
I You are encouraged to bring |
| your children to campu s this !
¦ week to participa te in the !
¦ Siblings ' Weekend program . ¦¦ Activities include a carnival in I
I the Union on Friday and |
I Saturday from 1 p.m. to 1 a.m., ¦
| a picnic on Saturday at 5 p.m. ¦
¦ and a learn ing experience "
I worksh op on arts and cra fts in I
I the Union on Sunday at 1 p.m. I

By VALERY O'CONNELL
Summer sess ion students ,

attend ing school to pick up a
few necessary credits , often
miss the opportunity that the
season offers for them to earn
money at a full time job.

But a new agency iri
Bloomsburg , the Temporary
Emergenc y Labor Company
(TELFCO ), corner of Seventh
and Market Streets , just may
provide such opportunit y for
these students.

TELFCO is similar to the
many tempor ary employment
agenc ies found in lar ge

Temporary Help
At Pe ak Season

metropolitan areas. Yet it is a
novel idea for Bloomsb urg and
is not an employment agency ,
per se, as the applicant never
has to pay a fee.

"The idea of the program ,"
commented manager Dan
Beyer, "is to provide temporary
help for area businesses during
their peak seasons. "

Summer time seems to be that
peak season and TELFCO has
jobs ava ilable in many labor
areas , especially the industrial ,
factor y and clerical fields.

(please turn to page four )
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Bloomsburg State College's
baseball squa d dropp ed a pair
of games to the Warr iors of
East Stroudsburg Monday. The
loss evened Bloomsburg State 's
recor d at seven wins and sevenlosses, after Sunday's pair oflosses to India na Univer sity.

WELLES AND MUM MEY
BSC's Line Welles, along with

Laverne Mumm ey, provid ed
the bulk of the Huskies ' offense
in the first game, .as the pair
contributed thre e hits and three
RBI to the locals effort.

Both came up with double s,
and Welles provided a single as
well as one stolen base.
Mummey accounted for two
RBI and Welles for one.

The only Husky to hit safely in
the first game was junior Bill
Russell , as BSC could only
manage a total of four hits
through the seven innings , and
the Warriors recorded the
samp

BSC led 2-0 after the first
inning, but East Stroudsbu rg
came back to toe it up in the top
of the second. The Huskies took

the lead again in the bottom of
the third . For two innings BSC
starter Lanny Sheehan held the
ESSC charges scoreless , but
then the visitor s came up with
two runs in their half of the sixth

to move out to the final 4-3
margin .

1ST GAME ACTION
In the first inning , with one

out , Welles singled for the
Huskie s, and stole second base,
then moved to thir d on a past
ball on ESSC's catcher , John
Varacall o. Bob DeCarolis
worked his way onto first with a
walk , then Mummey slammed
his double to score both his
teamm ates.

The locals' only other run
came in the third inning, when
Russell singled and Welles
doubled to push him across.

Duane Leeper claimed the
win for ESSC. He pitched five
and two-thirds innings, allowing
four hits and three runs , all
'earned while issuing five walks
and fanning two Husky bat-
smen. Wesco came on in relief
for the save.

Sheehan gained for the loss,
as he went for th§ full seven
innings , allowing four hits , four
runs , three earned , four walks
and striking out seven.

East Stroudsburg left five
men on base , while BSC
stranded three.

SECOND GAME
In the second game, BSC

could only mana ge a total of

three hits , and least Stroud-
sburg came up with four ,
scoring one earned run — and
two undarned — to claim the
victory, in a game called after
five innings .

The only Huskies to reach
base in the second encounter
were catcher DeCarolis ,
designated hitter Len Peterman
and shortstop Greg Oswald.
DeCarolis and Peterman
singled and Oswald , a
sophomore from Allen tow n ,
ripped a double.

"East Stroudsbur g jumped out
to a 2-0 lead in the top of the
first , then added another run in
their half of the fourth fra me.

Ryznar was the winnin g
pitcher , going five innings ,
allowing three hits and strikin g
out three Huskies. Joe Jacobs
absorbed the loss for BSC,
pitching five innings and giving
up three hits and three runs —
one earned—w hile walkin g five
anf fannin g three.

Both teams left men on base.

UPCOMING STARTS
The Huskies travel to Wilkes

College in Wilkes-Barre today
for a doubleheader and will be

) at Shippensburg State College
Thursday afternoon for two
games.
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BSC 9 drops Twin Bill
record now even

A member of the BSC Men's Tennis squad pla ys a serve during
recent action. The Huskies are on the road for the next few days as
they hope to keep up their winning ways.

(Photo by B. Jones )

The Women 's Tennis Team
opened their season , Tuesday,
April 23 with a victory over
Mansfield despite a slight rain
shower mid-way in the mat ch.
Playing singles in the numb er
one spot , Anne McMunn
defeated her opponent 6-1
6-2. Playing number two, Ann

McCoy was defeated 4-6, 2-6
after a hard match. Sheryl
Greiner won both sets 6-0 in the
third position . Val Cron in ,
playing the fourth won 6-0, 6-2.
Marianne Zane won 6-0, 64)
playing fifth and Ann Gruber in
the sixth position won 6-0, 6-1.

The Doubles matches proved
to be a bit more challenging .
The numbe r one doubles team

¦i

of Judy Scott and Mariann e
Zane playing well finally
defeated in the thir d set with a
mat ch score of 3-6, 6-1, 3-6.
Jenny Yost and Val Cronin won
their match 6-3, 6-2 and Ann
McCoy and Ann McMunn won 6-
0, 6-1.

SINGLES
McMunn 6 6 Gniber 6 6

1 2 0 1
McCoy 4 2

6 6 DOUBLES
Greiner 6 6 Scott 3 6 3

0 0 Zane 6 1 0
Cronin 6 6 Cronin 6 6

Q 2* Yost 3 2
Zane 6 6 McCoy 6 6

0 0 McMunn 0 1

Ann McMunn plays a shot during action last fall. The Husky
Netwomen are off to a stron g start as thty easi ly won their opener
'" ? week. (Photo by P. Whit e) . .,. , .

Women win
Tennis Opener

It was a gran d happening at
Numidia as two of the countr y's
best female drag racers went at
it head to head in Pro Stackers .
Add the spice of Ford vs.
Chevrolet and you have one fine
day at the drag s. J ean Brown of
Clinton , Md. just could not catch
her lovely companion as Carol
Burkett' s Pinto won three in a
row from the Brown Vega. Oh,
it was no run away, try a 9.79-
139 in the final round by Bur kett
as Jean Brown romped home
with a 10.13-134. This was the
first appearance in the '74 fort
he match race madness at
Numidia but by no means the
last. Keep your eye on your
favorite to follow the hot action
at Numidia Dragway.

.Bob Reed of Tamaqua ended
a long dry spell in competit ion
elim by putting his D-A Dodge
home first in front of a C
Dragster then came on to win
out over Lenn y Slodysko 's
Beautiful new D-A Vega. Len
hails from Shamokin and to be
sure you'll hear plenty more
from this car throughout the
season.

V

Nick Nash of Catawissa made
his first '74 appearance a
success as he wheeled his B-SR
to a fine Modified Eliminator
win . Nick 's machine is brand
new for '74 and seems to be

Numid ia :
Bun ny Burke ff Wins

A lot of credit has to go to
Paul Werner of Reading for
trying as hard as he does
throu ghout two seasons in Pro
Street. At a time when everyone
was running out of Pro Street
because Mike Moore of Oley is a
real tough contender , Paul kept
working. This week Paul had
his day and won Pro Street from
Mike Moore. Both machines
bettered their ecord at
Numidia . Moore went 10.86 and
Werner 11.73 which now stand
as New Record s in their
respective classes.
top Bike, once again , went to

Jim Yodock of Catawissa ,
Yodock had the most bike wins
last season and is well on his
way this season. Yodock went
12.74-102.73 to Bob
Macie jewsky 's 14.36-100.il.
This is Numidia RAceway, The
Place to Race. The money is on
the line and if anyone bothers to
think percentages , there is no
other strip that pays better . So
sooner or later , we 'll see you at
Numidia Racewa y.

Waste Not; Want Not
(fro m 4 page two ),

coura ged to participa te in the
Food Ecology Program. The
coordinators ar e looking for-
ward to a successful pro gram
and anticipate good coopera tion
from the studen t body .

Rememb er tha t an unused
margari ne patt y is a penny
wasted , The price s of unfinis hed
apples (7.8 cents) and oranges
(3.6 cents) adds up. If , we save
on wasted food toda y, we may
be able to save on money (never
considered a waste) tomorrow .

going stra ight for a change.
Nash beat Matt Reklaitis of
Pittston in the final heat with a
10.43 at 130.62 MPH as Matt' s F-
MP went 12.41-111.11.

The Kress Automo tive
Chevrolet is runnin g better
every week and make it to the
finals against May Naylor of
New Buffalo , Pa. At the far end
it was Sonny Kress with a super
fine 11.25-122.78 to Naylor 's D-
SA 11.54-121.13.

Lovable Lou once again made
his presence known in Stock
Eliminator. Morgantini runs an
H-SA Ford and gives the
Chevolets an kinds of problems
at Numidia. This week Lou of
West Pittston nipped Ed
Horensky of Sugar Loaf with a
13.40-87.54 to Ed's loosing 13.22-
87.63.

About the most contested
eliminator at Numidia is the
E.T , Brackets . Moody and
Weed of Exeter just about run

. their big Ford into the ground
every week, but today was their
day that ended at 7 p.m. for
them with their first season win.
Moody ran 12.93-91.00 to swat
Rick Walters of Swoyeraville.

SUPPORT

YOUR LOCAL

SPORTS

NUMIDIA DRAGWAY
EVERY SUNDAY
PIT GATE 10:30

SPECTATOR GAT E 12:00
ELIMINATIONS AT 3:00 p.nf.



COMMUNITY ACTIVITIES
The Collection of the Com-

munity Activities Fees will take
place May 1, 2, and 3 at the
Student Bank from 10:00 to 4:00.
The amount is $60.00.
Registration is by Social
Security Number. The schedule
is (on ly the first three digits of
the Social Security Number are
listed) : May 1 — 001-176; May 2
— 177-197; May 3 — 198-199 and
iaicv;vmiv:ia .

Please make all checks and
money orders payable to
Community Activities. You
may pay by either cash, check
or money order , in the amount
of $60.00. You must pay this fee
to register in the fall.

SUMMER CAMPUS JOBS
Students who submitted

applications for summer 1974
campus jobs should check their
campus mailboxes this week for
notification regarding ap-
proval . Any student not
receiving some notification
should come to the Financial
Aid Office, Room 19, Benjamin
Franklin.

SOCIAL WORK DAY
The Department of Sociology

and Anthropology will hold their
Annual Social Work Day in
Kuster Auditorium from 1 to
2:50 today. Dr. F. Monahan,
Dean of the School of Social
Work and two other faculty
members, Dr. G. Powers and
Mr. M. Freund, from Marywood
College will speak on "Job
Opportunities in the Field of
Social Work" and also the
Graduate Program at
Marywood. All interested
students are welcome.

PRACTICUM-INTERN
The Department of

Psychology has announced that
additional positions are
available for practicum-intern
c o m m u n i t y  exper ience .
Beginning in the fall , students
may receive course credit and,
in some cases, additional free
housing or nominal pay in ex-
change for 10 hours work per
week. Students may choose
from a variety of experiences at
Danville State Hospital, White
Haven State School, Selinsgrove
State School or several other
community agencies.

Any student may apply
through the Department of
Psychology (see Mrs. Long in
Room 31 Old Science).

Items of
Interest

(from page two )
The starting wage for most

employees is $2.25 per hour . The
industry is billed by TELFCO
and employees rece ive the ir
paychecks direc tly from
TELFCO.

It is possible that a temporary
person could work a full fort y
hour week but at different
locat ions in the immed iate
area . The agenc y's system of
application is conven ient both
for the agency and the ap-
plicant , as it provides space for
the applicant to state the times
he is ava ilable to work.

One advantage TELFCO has
above national agencies such as
Manpower and Kelly Girl is that
"if a company wished to hire its
temporary help permanently ,
they would not pay any kind of
thfl ii snnl ton "

TELF CO serves the entire
communit y, be they high school
or college students or senior
citizens wishing to supplement
their social security incomes .

"Our progr am bega n about a
month ago ," said Byer . "It
shows much promise and we
urge all BSC .students who
might be interested in earning
some cash to fill out an ap-
plicat ion. "

F orms may be obtained at the
Financi al Aid offices , Ben
Frankl in.

Tempora ry Help

CRACKER BARREL "~
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NITE

^̂ MCrrnj WeJneJac f ^̂ ^
^ li ft PHUTD Oil JIDPT^̂ 00- 10:30

^  ̂ WU uUVcK bHAKtaL
MARK ET ST. SUNOCO
SERVICE CENTER
7th and Market Sts .

Propr ietor
Rick Belinck v

784-8644

BABYSITTER
Wanted : Area gir l to babysit 1
to 2 Afternoon a week during
summer vaca tion. Call 784-
8730

TEACHERS WANTED
Entire West ,

Mid-West and South*
SOUTHWEST

TEACHERS AGENCY
Albuquerque, New Mexico

P.7106
1303 Centra l Ave. n.e.

Bonded, Licensed and
Members NATA "Our 28th
year"

HENRIEV
Card and Book Nook

40 W. Main St.

Now in stock

Silk flowers
from Europe

at the

Studio Shop
TAXES

Don 't forget to pay you r
taxes!! If you are exempt
from paying it , exonera tion
forms may be fi led with
Geraldine S. Kern, Tax
Collector , Main Street ,
Bloomsburg. A ninety day
payment period is in effect
from the date of the bill.

Hartzei' s Music Store
72 N. Iron St.

Over 300 Guitars
and Amplifiers

Dr. Wm. Weir , O.D.
21 E. Fifth Str eet

Bloomsburg, Pa. 17815
Phone 784-2131

By Appointment
Eye Examinations
Contact Lens Svc.

Miller Office
Supp ly Co.

IS West Main Street, Bloomsburt, Pa.
HEADQUARTERSOF
HALLMAR K CARDS

AND GIFTS
Phone 784-2561

BILL'S
USED FURNITURE

Rohrsburg , Pennsylvani a
Used Furnitur e of

All Kinds
784-1063 or 784-0721

Mini-sets in cotton and ny lon ,
also sleepshirts. Bab ydolls ,
swimsu its - all new , spring
shades in sty les.

at

EUDORA S
W^̂  ̂ ^̂ B^̂ B ̂ BB ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ aPBI ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦§ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦§ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ ¦W ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦ ¦¦¦¦

j WARHURST APARTMENTS j
i Summer School off-cam pus j
j housing. 24 hour answerin g service , i
| 784-8833 I

I Ritte r's I
I Office Supply I
I 112 E. Main St. I
I Bloomsburg, I
I 784-4323 I

Eppley's
Pharmacy

MAIN & IRON STREETS

Prescription Specialist

•CHANEL
•GUERLAIN
•FABERGE
•LANVIN
•PRINCE MATCHABEILI
•ELIZABETH ARDEN
•HELENA RUBENSTEIN .
•DANA
•COTY
•MAX FACTOR

Grvwi Stomps

Mi^HMflMBShHBrihMMHMHri ^HBBMMrffcMtt ^H^^Mi^^ MM^̂ ^̂ M

John 's Food
Market

W. Mai n & Leona rd St.
Open 8 a.m. to 12 mid-

night Daily
Delicatessen

Full line of groceries
& snacks

mmmmmmmmmmmmmm

IHUMPViB ^MBlSlB^^V^^ MIIB ^n^HH

New Modern Effic iency Apt.
for rent this Summer. Call
after 3:30 p.m.

Mon. - Wed .
784- 1105

¦Sssa î^̂ M _

Hftwl
I your purse ' | ̂ j jgSPx f T} I

I get in §i^ ui ** > 11 I
I your hair! ^̂ ^^̂ 2  ̂ s I
¦ Tho earth shattering noiso from this purse-fittjng horn I¦ gives you the protection you've been looking for agoinst I¦ muggers nnd rapists. Just snap two penlight batteries into I¦ this amazing now Vigilant Aliirm and you're ready, No I¦ wires required, Complete package includes super simple ' I¦ instructions showing how the Alarm can also be easily ¦¦ ,sinstalled on windows or doors'. GET VIGILANT BEFORE I¦ THEY GET YOU. ¦
¦ supplv Limited mail this coupon todayi I I¦ Sond mo n( Vlgilsnt Burglar Alurmi H¦ I oncloioJd'OO'or each VlQllont Alarm. r , . ., . .  I¦ I undantand thnt.lf I am not totally ffl""* •'•w*'1 Ltd. ¦
¦ latliliod, I will rocolvuo complBle rolund ?*?1 W,M1 y'"»'«« *«""• ¦
¦ If roturnod within 10 (inv i- Mllw.ukM , Wliooniln 53209 ¦
'¦ NAME»_ I
<fl ADDRESS ' I
¦ CITY STATE ZIP I
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PHOTO SERVICES
06 C. Main Street

Bloomsburg , Pa.

784-1947




