
20-30 FRESHMEN ARE
ENR OLLIN G ON MARCH 1

Largest Number at Mid-Term
With the Trimester beginning on

March 1, 1944, an entering class of 20
to 30 studen ts are expected to enroll.
While a few are former student s, a
great maj ority are Freshmen. They
come from all sections of Eastern
Pennsylvania and from the neighbor-
ing states of New York, North Caro-
lina , New Jersey and Maryland.
Among those expected to register are
the following:

Peggy Lou Anthony, Dorothy R.
Baldwin, William P. Barrett, Dora
Brown, Henry Gatski, Emily John
Hess, Dorothy Martini , Nancy Mc-
Henry, Louise Buck Miller , Diana M.
Pelensky , Horace E. Readier , Carl R.
Ruck, Kathleene Schutauri , Jose-
phine E. Sheely , Agnes M. Walsh,
Catherine Ward , Anthony L. Zekas,
John Barbase, Mary Manion.

The students enrolling on March 1
will complete one trimester on or be-
fore July 1.

According to President Harvey A.
Andruss, this is a larger number
1han is generally enrolled at the be-
ginning of a second session during
the college year.

STUDENT TEACHER SPEAKS
AT BUSINESS EDUC. CLUB

Three members of the Department
of Business Education , Joyce Hay,
Ann Sabol and Sam Mazzeo, gave an
insight into student teaching at the
meeting' of the Business Education
Club on February 3.
t The three students , who had taught

in the Bloomsburg and Danville High
Schools, presented interesting re-
sumes of their experiences. They
discussed such things as overcoming
nervousness, action with disciplinary
problems, preparation of lesson plnns,
and the necessity for changes in the
plan to meet individual class needs.

The prospective teachers related
many amusing incidents in their
teaching, and concluded by advising
the club members to closely observe
the methods used by their teachers as
an invaluable aid in their own teach-
ing,

Latest addition to the staff at
Bloomsburg is Lt. J. G. Vincent C.
Olshefski, M. C, who replaces Lt. J.
G. M. Schiff , M. C. now in training
at the Amphibious Forces Base, New
River, North Carolina.

Dr. Olshefski has recently returned
to this coun try from the Southwest
Pacific area . While in the South Seas,
Dr. Olshefski was medical officer in
the C. B.'s (Construction Battalion) .

Dr. Olshefski, whose home is in Mt.
Carmel , Pa., studied Pre-medical at
Bucknell University and Penn State
Col lege. In 1939? he was graduated
from the Hahnemann Medical Col-
lege at Hahnemann Hospital, Phila-
delphia , Pa.

While in college, Lt. J. G. Olshef-
ski belonged to Phi Kappa fra ternity,
and during that time actively engag-
ed in baseball, basketball and soccer.

Following the completion of his in-
ternship at Potts ville Hospital, Potts -
ville, Pa., Dr. Olshefski established
his practice in Mt. Carmel.

In August , 1942, realizing the cry-
ing need for doctors in war zones,
Dr. Vincent C. Olshefski offered his
services to the Navy. The Navy did
not hesitate, and shortly after , Lt. J.
G. Olshefski found himself attached
to the Norfolk Naval Operating Base,
Norfolk , Va. It was here that he be-
came acquainted with the heroic and
gallant work of the C. B.'s. It was
from here tha t Lt . Olshefski moved
into the Southwest Pacific area with
the C. BAs.

Having served in that area for a
six-month period to their complete
satisfaction the Navy decided Lt. J.
G. Olshefski deserved a rest. In the
latter part of September , 1943, the
Lieutenant found himself back on
American shores once more.

Following his service in the Pacific
area , Dr. Olshefski was attached to
the Philadelphia Naval Hospital at
Philadelphia until January 18, 1944,
at which time he was transferred to
the Naval unit at B. S. T. C.

Dr. Olshefski is married and both
his wife and his two and a half year
old daughter are nearby. So it was
no surprise when asked what he
thought of Bloomsburg he said sim-
ply , "Pretty Nice."

College Communit y
Gains New Medico

SOCIAL ROOMS OPEN
The Social Rooms of Noetling Hall

arc open daily from 8:00 A. M. until
9:50 P. M., except Sundays, when
it is opened from 1:00 P. M. until 9:50
P. M. The committee to be in charge
of the Social Rooms consists of Ann
Sabol , college student; Charles Green,
V-12, and Lucille Martino , college
council.

As is previous policies, this one
states that smoking, eating and danc-
ing are not permitted. Every member
of the campus is invited to use the
Social Rooms and take his responsi-
bility in seeing that they stay open.

PRESIDENT H. A. ANDRUSS
ATTENDS SENATE HEARING

On Tuesday, February 1, President
Harvey A. Andruss attended the Sen-
ate Commerce Sub-Committee hear-
ing in Washington, D. C, on C. P. T.
training in colleges all over the Unit-
ed States.

In chapel Friday, February 4, he
explained the 'present conditions.

Since Army Air Force casualties
have been so far below expectation,
and there is a super abundance of
trained fliers , the War Department is
cancelling certain training programs
in colleges and universities having
air crew training. Nearly 1000 col-
leges, universities, teacher colleges,
normal schools and junior colleges
will be effected.

The colleges and airports are not
willing to have this training ended,
because they have set aside their fa-
cilities and faculties to do a prelimin-
ary job for the Federal Government
to further the war eflort. Expendi-
tures have been made by colleges and
airports and faculties have had to ac-
custom themselves to teach in other
fields. They do not want to give'up
their facilities just because the Gov-
ernment has built their own, So the
representatives urge the committee
as much as they can to continue the
C. P. T. program for five years after
its expiration date of July 1, 1944.

Witnesses at the hearing included
besides President Andruss, Dr, Ever-
ett Needham Case, president of Col-
gate University ; Dr. T. A. Disler,

(Pleaae Turn to P age Two)

COLLEGE WOMEN GATHER
FOR FUN FROLIC FEB. 11

Friday , February 11, found the day
and dorm girls rushing to the old
gym for the annual 4-F Party . No,
this 4-F refers to Farrnette Fall Fun
Frolic. The postponement of the par-
ty since last November rightly chang-
es it to a 3-F Party .

The party ran from 7:00 to 10:00
P. M. All women of the faculty and
faculty wives were guests of the col-
lege girls.

Poletime Comuntzis was chairman
of the games and program commit-
tees. Pauline Niles was chairman of
the refreshment and advertising com-
mittees. Those helping the chairmen
were: Refreshments, Helen Fehl, Kay
Kurilla; Advertising, Margaret Lat-
sha , Shirley Williams; Games, Atha-
montia Comuntzis, Jacqueline Shaf-
fer , Anita Behler; Program, Eltheda
Klingaman , Frances Saunders, and
Evelyn George.

The program included round and
square dancing, relays, races and re-
freshments. Costumes ranged from
scarecrows to sharecroppers.

V-12's Will Hold Fa rewell Dance
At the Elks Home On Februar y 18

Red McCarthy Orchestra of Har-
risburg, Will Provide the

Music
The V-12's await February 18 with

impatience. This is the date of the
Navy Farewell Dance, one of the top-
notch events for this year for the V-
12 Unit . Walter Wagenhurst is the
general chairman.

To be at Elks
The dance is to be held at the Elks

Club from 8:30 to 12:30. Frank
Schreiber and T. P. Lee have engag-
ed Harrisburg's outstanding band,
non other than Red McCarthy and his
15-pi ece band.

Committees
The V-12's who are assisting Wag-

enhurst are: Orchestra , Frank Schrei-
ber and Thomas P. Lee; Dance Pro-
grams, Raymond L. Dehler ; Favors,
Henry A. Caruso and Robert Taylor;
Flowers, Letcher T. White; Decora-
tions, Donald McGlathery; Location ,
Richard M. Langdon and Joseph F.
Smith; Treasurer, Joseph F. Smith,
and Secretary , Warren A. Reichlen.

The tapping on third deck heard
nightly is not woodpeckers but ham-
mers used by "Don" McGlathery,
"Bill Shildmacher and "Rod" Wil-
liams in preparation for the decora-
tions guaranteed to be the best ever
seen.

o 

The administration has approved
the opening of the new gym two eve-
nings of every week for the college
girls. According to this program the
girls will have access to any of the
facilities every Monday and Thurs-
day evenings from 7:00 to 10:00.

Each week one of the two evenings
will include the girls from the neigh-
boring high schools. On the other
evening of the week, the gym will be
open exclusively to the college girls.
There will be cage ball at 7:00, bas-
ketball at 8:00, ping pong and bad-
minton tournaments until 10:00 and
swimming throughout the entire eve-
ning. Miss Lucy McCamtnon will
supervise all activities. The B Club
will be helping with the promotion of
this plan.

The program will provide a re-
creational center within the college.
Best of all, however, -will be the in-
crease in B Club points and the de-
crease in waistline measurements.

o 

College Host to
High School Gir ls



A "Peace Angelus has been insti-
tuted on the Westminister College
campus and is being observed daily
in coopera tion with a movement
started by two young boys of the Ben
Avon Presbyterian Church. Each
evening at seven, the victory bell in
"Old Main" tower is rung as a signal
for one minute of silent prayer. Stu-
dents and townspeople are asked to
stop whatever they are doing when
they hear the bell and offer prayer
for peace.

Since the idea was started in the
Pittsburgh area about November 1, it
has spread rapidly to many commun-
ities where residents feel that sincere
prayer will help to prepare them for
the sacrifices that must come with a
durable and just peace.
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John Paul Jones, in his latest post-
humorous communique, gives the ail
inclusive definition on the United
States Navy—"Together we stick, di-
vided we are stuck, all for one, one
for all , and every man for, himself ."

—The Collegio.

"A Man 's a Man For A' That—
There is to be no shortage of mar-
riageable males after the war. say
three University of Chicago sociolo-
gists, who point out the fact that cas-
ualties so far have been small and
that medical care for the wounded
has developed to the extent that
more lives are being saved than ever
before. These three optimistic pro-
lessors figure that , even af ter making
a liberal allowance for casualties,
there will still be a man for every
girl in America . But tell us, profes-
sor , won 't they be "ei ther too young or
too old?" —Washington Un.v.

A take-off on "Trees"
I think that I shall never date
A boy who keeps me out till late.
A boy whose eager eye is gaged
Upon some blonde who's all the rage.
A boy who whistles from cross the

street.
Ov just sv.ys "Hi-ya " when we meet.
Eoys ai"o loved by girls like me;
But Uncle Sam gets two out of three!

—Indiana Penna.

Randall "Sheriff' Johnson is only
a Freshman in the police science
course at Washington State College,
but he's already hard at work on his
first big case.

The situation that is challenging
his talents is that of a burglary at 704
Linden in which two men broke into
a room and took two cartons of ciga-
rettes, a sport coat , a suitcase, a train
ticket to Seattle and $10 in cash.

Randy vows that he'll solve the
case if i t's humanly possible. In fact,
he's quite stirred up about the case.
You see, it was his room.
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ATTENDS SENATE MEETING

(Continued Fro m Pa ge One)
president of Franklin and Marshall
College, and representatives of the
Association of American Colleges, the
National Catholic Education Associa-
tion , the American Association of
Junior Colleges, American Associa-
tion of Teachers Colleges, Association
of Universities and Colleges in Avia-
tion Training and u number of trade ,
civil and patriotic organizations.

LETTER TO THE EDITOR
To the Editor:

Yesterday as I passed by the Ma-
roon and Gold office , I noticed once
more that the C. G. A. plaque, out-
side of this office , did not bear the
names o£ ouv 1942-43 Presidents,
Eoyd Buckingham and Joanne Fice.

In former years the additional
metal strip with the engraved names
would be up by the end of that year.
Is this due to an oversight , indiffer-
ence, or is this , too, to be blamed on
shortage and priori ties again?

Both Boyd and Joanna were well-
liked by the entire college commun-
ity not only for their amicable per-
sonalities but also for their capabil-
ity in handling and execution of the
responsibilities as C. G. A. Presidents.

During the past year many have
noticed the absence of the names on
this plaque and said nothing concern-
ing it, but as members of the Com-
munity Government Association, it is
about time we were given a satisfac-
tory reply.

An Interested Membei .
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B. S. T. C.
Dear Aunt Penelope:

I attended that open meeting of C.
G. A. a few weeks ago and listened
to a very interesting discussion on the
Social Rooms of B. S. T. C. How-
ever, there were several terms used
in the discussion that puzzles me.
What is misconduct, Aunt Penelope ,
and what do they mean by necking?
I want to use those social rooms in-
telligently, but how can I if I don 't
know what is frowned on by the col-
lege community .

Sincerely,
A. Dope.

Dear Dope:
Naturally you want to do the right

thing, and I am j ust the person to
help you do just that.

First , to clear up those two terms—
misconduct is simply the popular in-
door spor t of osculation. The other
term "necking," obviously means to
wash the neck. Now you can see,
Dear, tha t the social rooms are not a
place for a part-bath . Well , that
clears that up, doesn't it?

If you find , however, that your
young man insists on a little oscula-
tion in the social rooms, you might
try the following methods:

As he bends toward you to plant a
kiss on your langee dip your head
suddenly to the side and bit him in
the j ugular vein of the neck. This
will prove fatal , but it's a cinch he
won't bother you any more.

I have seen some foolish girls say
"no" firmly bu t "no" means the green
light to the average male and there
is no fu ture in that. It would be
much smarter to say "No, Rudolph , I
only like you as a brother." He'll
love That.

I have also tried the "shove your
index finger in his eye" method. Its
mossy but effective.

A more suble but just as effective
i way is the "onion breath approach."
There is a chance he may have eaten
t hem too, so be prepared.

Well, there they are dear. Take
them i'oivwhnt they are worth. I am
1'iurly sure they will work , because
I've Vised them. That's why the cir-
culars I get in my mail are addressed
lo M^s Penelope Parsnip.

Affectionately,
Aunt Penelope.

P. S. Our new Social Rooms motto
shall be "Osculation results in iso-
lation."

Personalities
• The ending of this trimester will
see a handful more of our Seniors on
'he accelerated program graduating.
Among them will be Pauline Niles ,
Marj ory Sharretts and Stella Wil-
liams. Before they leave, let's take
;i farewel l look at them.

Pauline Niles
During the three years since she

entered B. S. T. C. as a transfer from
the Penn State Center at DuBois, we
have known her as Pauline Garey. A
trip out to Oklahoma during the
Christmas vacation changed this.
There, on New Year 's Day, she be-
came Mrs. Hugh S. Niles. This is all
in keeping with the best of Blooms-
burg traditions as "Red" was a grad-
uate of B. S. T. C. last January. Thus
you have the explanation for Polly's
walking through the halls with an
"out of this world" expression on her
a";ice. Polly, maj oring in languages,
plans on teaching— at least , for the
the duration.

Margre Sharretts
Another Senior who graduates in

February is Marge Sharretts. Marge
has her loyalty divided between the
Day Women and the Dorm Women as
she has been a member of both or-
ganizations. It's been rumored that
Marge's thoughts are not always cen-
tered on Bloomsburg. Her interest
in historical figures is amazing—
Grant in particular . This year Marge
has been what is known as "one of
those poor elementary student teach-
ers." Bear up, Marge, it will soon
all be a lovely memory.

Stella Williams
Even though she may be a digni-

fied Senior now, remember the night
of the Frosh Kid Party when Stella
Williams , dressed in a little girl's
party dress, was wearing herself out
j itterbugging with Kenny Morse?
And she hasn 't lost any of that viva-
cious energy. Proof of the fact is that
she served so capably as general
chairm an of the Senior Ball and
Banqu et. Dor 't lose that spirit , Stel-
la , when you start in as as elemen-
tary teacher. As for here at college,
Stella 's younger sister, Shirley , will
carry on.

The coaching staff of B. S. T. C.
had vivid dreams of the prospective
material that should be in a V-12
uni t. When this staff realized that
such a small contingent was being
sent 1o them, their dreams collapsed.
Actually there was no need for any
angu ;sh. With such athletes as Rich-
ard Bierly, Bernard Ganley and Ed-
ward Vogelsong attendin g the college
its athletic future brightened.

Dick Bierly
The fac t that Dick Bierly 's name

usually heads the scoring columns of
Bloomsburg's papers is not at all
strange. Dick began leading his track
in points scored quite early. When
he was in the seventh grade , Bierly
scored the only point that was made
by his intra-mural team. This was
his firs t basketball game.

Bierly graduated from Kutztown
High School. Later he attended the
Kutztown State Teachers College,
where he was coached by the present
V-5 Cadet physical instructor , Lt.
(S. G.) McGovern.

Bierly was outstanding at Kutz-
town in soccer and track as well as
biisketball.

Incidentally Dick leuves for ad-
vanced training In February .

Bornic Ganle y
The Navy is far from new to Ber-

nie Ganley. Before ho enlisted he
shipped on a Great Lukes freighter.
Perhaps Bernie didn 't like the water

P >ie<ientia <f

On Jan uary 28, 1944, in chapel
Bernard Kane conducted the open C.
G. A. meeting for tire nominations of
president. The nominees for this of-
fice were us follows: Betty Hagcn-
buch , Harold Miller , Margaret Deem
and Juliun Zinzarella.

In chapel on February 4 each can-
didate presented his own platform
speech . Promises ranged from strong
student government to pledge for no
fourth term.

Students and elections faculty vot-
ed for two candidates in the pri m my
election Monday, February 7. The
final voting to decide between the
I wo will be announced later.

STUDENTS VOTE IN
C. G. A. ELECT ION

too well. If he did not, the fact that
he is now a prospective V-5 candi-
date is qui te phrasible. Ganley has
already acquired a pilot's license and
has twenty-five solo hours.

Ganley graduated from Indiana
High School and then attended In-
diana Stale Teachers College. He
was outstanding in track , football
and basketball at both high school
and college.

Bernie's defensive basketball , as
well as his sparkling floor game play-
ed for B. S. T. C, is well worth men-
tioning .

Eddie Vogelsong
The small and agile Eddie Vogel-

song is indeed a credit to the East
Stroudsburg State Teachers College.
While still a Freshman, Eddie played
varsity basketball for East Strouds-
burg. The unique ball handling of
this black haired lad has a definite
place on the college quintet. Eddie's
shortness would seem to be to his
disadvan tage. What he lacks in
height is more than compensated by
his def tness.

Vogelsong is a gradua te of Me-
chanicsburg High School.. He was
majoring in Physical Education at
college.

Bloomsburg is glad to have Eddie
play for the Huskies instead of
against them as he did the previous
year.



Yanks in Britain Can Purchase Fav-
orite Magazine From G. I. Newsie
Somewhere in Britain—The ETO's

firs t official G. I. newsie is Pfc. .Oscar
Spielberg of the Bronx , N. Y., who
operates a stand built by Special Ser-
vice at an Eighth Air Force station.

It's got plenty of class, this news-
stand , a lot mc*e than the job Pfc.
Spielberg used to run back at the
corner of Grand Concourse and
Fordham Road. Though it sells only
YANK and the Stars and Stripes, we
are happy to say that the newsie re-
ports no kicks from his customers.

Or rather, just one kick—and here
is Oscar's own version of that: "Ev-
erything was going swell ," he says.
"The guys that didn't hnvc the change
I would trust , something I would
never do at Grand Concourse and
Fordham Road. Nobody asked for
personal delivery and ripped copies
went as easy as whole ones. Then
this hapoens.

"A mug by the name of Paul
Klinger—he's nothing more than a
Pfe., either, see—comes up to my
stand and says, very fancy : 'News-
boy, 1 should like to have a copy of
the Berwick Enterprise.' I look at
him, figuring Berwick's some burg
around here and I tell him: 'Come
back tomorrow, Bud ,' Well , he comes
back tomorrow — and for a week
straight, even on a Sunday.

"It seems , he won't take what's
good enough for everybody else in
this camp—our own YANK or Stars
and Stripes. No, that's not good
enough for him. I even offer him
some British racing forms, which I'm
saving to send home to my mom on
Mother's Day.

"After a week of this bothering, I
ask him near where is this Berwick
Enterprise printed and if it is a
newspaper or what.

" 'My good man,' he says to me 'of
course it is a newspaper and I am
surprised you never heard of it. For
your information , it has a paid circu-
lation of 3,465 and Berwick is in
Pennsylvania, near Wapwallopen and
Shickshinny.'

"I got rid of him' quick when I
heard such words. I sent him to the
Red Cross. That straightened him
out. They let him read the Bronx
Home News."

"Swish"
Cpl. H. W. Swisher.

Received two issues of the Maroon
and Gold today and really was glad
to get them. I hope you will contin-
ue to send them since they are a
great help in knowing what is going
on.

Well, here I am somewhere in
Northern Ireland. It really is nice
over here and the people treat us
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\ LIFE WITH UNCLE ]
! BY B. W. KANE <
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CYCLE
By JOHN GILMA N

Summer was hot and dry . Dust
stifled the land. It seeped deep into
the people causing their blood to dry
up. It entered the soils, blasting them
with hffa t and dryness. Finally all
was dri ed and dusty. The rivers gave
but a trickle , bodies moved little and
thought was but a trickle, too. Noth-
ing stirred in the souls except a
meaningless wondering.

Autumn came. It was cooler and
dryer. Both bodies and land seemed
almost dead. The souls did seem
completely dead. At the end cold
rains came. They were useless. They
made need of the rivers, need of the
blood and dust in the bodies, mud of
the sorrow and discord in the souls.

Winter followed and held them in
its grasp. It froze the mud of the
land , it froze th e mud of the body
and of the soul. Nature covered it all
with a blanket of white, ashamed of
herself.

But now it is spring, early spring.
The rivers are swollen, brown, car-
rying off the ice cakes. The poor soil.
The soul and body are in flood stage
too . Illnesses break up and depart ,
sorrows are washed away.

The sky clears, the waters abate.
The land becomes fresh, green. It
promises a good year. The bodies be-
come vibrant , the soul stir free. They
too , promise abundan t growth. The
people unite, the souls unite in pray-
er. The people, souls and earth re-
unite. All promise of the wonders to
be done.

All our crops start , all our new life,
all my green bosom swell with plants.
Surely by our unity we have beaten
the blast that withers crops, that
dries up souls tha t destroy the body.
Surely abundance will be ours for-
evermore.

Then it is summer. Man forgets
his promise to earth. The land grows
tired and does not work. The soul
shrivels, the dust and heat close in ,
suffoc ating annihilating. The cycle
ib complete.

Many will remember S/Sgt. Peter
DeRose at the college. His brother
James was president of one of the
classes abou t six years ago. Peter at-
tended B. S. T. C. but never did get
to finish because of the war. But I
am sure the faculty will remember
both of ihem. Well, anyhow, Peter is
working in our Group Headquarters
which is attached to our Squadron.
So w-2 often get together and drew
the f at about the college, recalling
people, places, etc. It is really swell
to hav e someone like that. Incident-
ally, Peter and I used to live next
door to each other.

I also met Lt. Bill Davies here
about three weeks ago. But he is now
nt March Field in California with a
B-17 outfit. He looks good and isj ust as full of fun as he ever was. I
met John Thomas about three monthsago in Salt Lake City . So you see,you do meet old college friends all
over the country .
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When I met you my life seemed
young,

As though all things had just begun
Things were so different from the

start ,
When you placed gladness in my

heart.
When I met you the sun was bright,
The flowers and trees a gorgeous
' sigh t.
The whole world danced before my

eyes,
My heart gave many fluttering sig

^
hs.

When I met you I knew for me
My life was like the rolling sea,
And in my heart there was a wave,
Of thoughts and memories that you

gave.
When I met you a friend I found ,
Sincere and kind and very sound.
And so the years roll on their way,
I'll always dream of you each day.
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WHEN I MET YOU
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swell. I was in England for a while
and had the good fortune to bump
into Lee Bea umont.

True Course
Capt. Willard J. Davies.

The last year I have spent in Camp
Stewart , Ga., in a colored anti-air-
craft battalion. In training a unit, I
have found tha t you do one of two
things—teach classes or attend class-
es. Tried to teach about one hundred
men to read and write and am quite
sure now I did the right thing in tak-
ing a commercial course.

Phil Frankmore is in the Navy at
Sampson , N. Y., and my old room-
mate, Shel Jones, is an ensign.

Officer Promotion
Wendover Field , Utah—Announce-

ment was made here today of the
promotion of Captain John Rutter
Ohl , Jr., from First Lieutenant. The
advancement became effective on
December 13th. Captain Ohl is as-
sistant Base Director of Supply.

A native of Bloomsburg, Pa., Cap-
tain Ohl enlisted on October 2-8, 1941
and received his basic training at
Keesler Field . He studied teletype
maintenance at Chanute Field and
leter was assigned to McClellan Field
where he advanced to Corporal.

Captain John Rutter Ohl attended
Officers ' Candidate School at Miami
Beach and received his commission
as Second Lieutenant on August 5,
1942. Shipped to Fort George Wright
at Spokane, Washington , Ohl was as-
signed as Adjut ant of the base squad-
ron. During his tenure there, he held
several other posts, among them be-
ing: Engineer-Property Officer; Cus-
todi al Officer and Assistant Base S-4
officer .

Transferred to Fairmont Army
Base in Geneva , Nebraska , as com-
manding officer of an airdrome
squadron , Ohl became First Lieuten-
ant on February 24, 1943. He later
served there as Base S-R officer also.

On December 22, Captain Ohl was
sent to Wendover Field as assistant
Base Direc tor of Supply and it was
upon his arrival here that he was
notified of his promotion to Captain.

Captain Ohl was graduated from
Bloomsburg State Teachers College
in May , 1941, majoring in English
and Geography. While there he was
president of the Gamma Theta Upsi-
lon , a chapter of the National Geo-
gvaphic Fraternity. Captain Ohl was
also president of the Intrafraternity
Council ; member ' of the wrestling
team; made the Junior Varsity track
team; member of the college mixed
choral group and A Capella choir;
staff writer of the Maroon and Gold
for two years and of the 1940-41 Year
Book.

Captain Ohl lived with his parents
at 512 Jefl'erson Street in Bloomsburg
prior to his entry into the service.
He married Miss Valma Gilman,
West 1717 8th Avenue, Spokane ,
Washing ton , ten months ago. At the
present Captain and Mrs. Ohl make
their home in Wendover.

Meetin g the Boys
Pfc. Hnrry John.

Well , I suppose you are wondering
where I am and what I am doing? I
om working in the Engineering Of-
fice of n Bombardment Squadron in
Utah. The work is easy ; about all I
do is type passes and call planes eith-
er "In" or "Out" of commission.

In the halls of B. S. T. C. there are
many opinions' on -every subject. In
this column will appear the quoted
opinions of members of the student
body on some question of interest to
the group at a whole. This week the
question asked by your "Roving Re-
porter" of students was: "What is
your opinion on Federal subsidy of
Education?" Here are some of the
replies:

Frank Schreiber says, "Federal
subsidy of education will be just an-
other step toward a socialistic state,
although education does not need a
definite boost."

Shirley Wolfe says, "Federal sub-
sidies could give small schools many
advantages not available through lo-
cal school districts."

Bernard Kane says, "At the pres-
ent time most of our states have suf-
ficien t funds to finance public edu-
cation , using the same satisfactory
methods which produced the think-
ing men and women who are doing
so much for America on every bat-
tlefront in the world. From the point
of view of state's rights, educators
cannot accept Federal subsidies with-
out running the risk of Federal con-
trol. The Federal Government con-
trols education , they can establish a
curriculum which may so shape the
minds of our youths that we will lose
the true Americanism we hold so
precious.

\j . — .
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* *: campus quotes :
jj 'Mr, Reams (bell is rin ging)— j
• "Your assignment for tomor- •
I row is " ' :
: Mr. Gehri g—"In the main " X
"• Paulino Niles—"You 're not kid - :
: ding."
: Jean Ackerm an—"Like the dc- :
: vil." ¦
• Edna Snyder— "Ma ybe you don 't •
; think I know that hug, maybe ;
! you don 't" I
• P e g g y  H o n e s  s—"Gee tanks j
• (thanks ) arm y tanks. " j
: Mr. Wagner—"On that oasis, it's ;
¦ relatively simple." |
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The varsity came in second in a
hard fought game last Saturday
night, when they lost to Muhlenburg
at Rockne Hall, Allentown, 67 to 51.

Much to the surprise of the 3,000
fans, the Huskies showed the mighty
Mules that a 5 man outfit can really
show'them some rugged competition.

Home boys were giving Bloomsbu-rg
40 points before the game and after
the first 10 minutes it looked like a
safe bet. The Mules had the combin-
ation of the Teachers' zone defense
and racked up a 19 to 4 lead in no
time.

Mules Are Stubb orn
Hank Baietti, former Long Island

U. AU-American flipped them in fre-
quently , with Dick Miller of Bethany
winging long ones, and "Mel" Mun-
son, 6 foot 3 center, laying in his
share. These three boys covered the
stratosphere surrounding the basket
rather efficiently. If the ball wouldn't
go through the first time, they mere-
ly tapped it around till it made the
point. Thus, it appeared that the
Huskies were in for a tough night.

Huskies Chan ge Tactics
In the second quarter, the team

used man to man defense and
brought the score up to a nine point
margin. Then the Mules put on their
down the floor and in the basket E.ct,
and put the score to 47-34.

Bloom Narrows Mar gin
Coach Julian sent in subs then ,

thinking perhaps, that the game was
on ice. In five minutes the Muhlen-
burg varsity was back in the play.
With "Red" Graham playing a migh-
ty hot game, the boys from Bloom
had narrowed it down to a 7 point
margin. The game ended with Muh-
lenburg leading by 16 points.

Bloomsbur ff
Goals F. G. Pts .

Bierly, I 6 1-3 13
Vogelsong, f. 3 1-1 7
Graham, c. 7 1-2 15
Goepfert , g. 2 3-5 7
Ganley, g, 4 1-2 5)

Totals 22 7-13 51
Muhlenburg

Smith 2 1-0 4
Miller 6 1-1 13
Triebcl 3 2-4 8
Davis 1 0-0 2
Munson, — 3 6-7 12
Doumont 1 0-0 2
Capehcu't 1 2-2 4

Mule s Set Hu skies
Back a.t Allentown ;

Ha rd Fought Game
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I ATTENTI ON! :
i « ¦

; Don 't forget the play "Junior ;
; Miss" on Februar y 17. To mem- I
I bers of the college community «
| the price is 28 cents and to all •
; others 55 cents. The small en- J
I trance fee will be used to defra y I
I the expense of the high royalty. ¦
| The play will begin prom ptly ¦
; at 8:0 P. M. Buy your ticket S
; from any member of the Drama- {
j .  tic .Clwb toda y, ¦
^••¦•••••¦¦¦•¦¦¦•¦•¦•••¦¦•¦••¦¦¦¦¦¦¦i4<

There are possibilities that the
game last Wednesday with Bucknell
did not bring down the curtain on the
Huskie's basketball season as anoth-
er strong foe may be added to our j
schedule. If this contest gets the
green light, the fans will have an op-
portunity of observing an "honest to
goodness" All-American in action
against our Huskies.

Sadowski Leade r
The match being considered is with

the Olmstead Airbase of Middletown, :
Pa., and should this game be san-
ctioned there would be plenty of ex-
citement in the Centennial Gym-
nasium for the Olmsteaders are head-
ed by the one and only "All-Ameri-
can Sadowski," a 6' 7" service man
who matriculated at Seton Hall. Sa-
dowski and Seton Hall are connected
with basketball as Harmon and
Michigan are with football.

Win Over New Cumberland
The Olmstead Airbase quintet has

been winning regularly and one of
their victories was a 43-29 win over
the New Cumberland outfit. The very
same team which the Huskies beat
by a one-point margin in a thrilling
game won by Goepfert's last minute
field goal.

Even in losing, the Army from
Middletown looked impressive. They
lost by 6 points to Sampson N. T. S.,
i\ naval five rated as one of the top

i

Game With Olmste ad
Proposed For Bloom

V-12 LIF E !
Life among the V-12's took a

rather abrupt change—for .the bet-
ter—this week. The installation of
the new system of student officers
has helped a lot in maintaining study
conditions and discipline.

The announcement that restricted
men could not attend the February
18th dance was really a shock. No
previous mention had been made and
ail the men had their plans made.

One fellow on the restricted list
after hearing the news said, "What
am I gonna do? I just sent my girl
bus fare , paid my admission fee and
rented a room for her. To top it off ,
she just bought a new gown too." In-
teresting dilemna!

The patch on Stoops' head came
from his attempting a swan dive
from the cargo net in the pool , 6' 3" ,
tall and he dives into 3 feet of water.

Liberty has been granted for the
men to attend the Dramatic Play on
February 17. Can you picture those
V-12 actors in civies? They wqn 't
know how to act.

It seems one prof, here has been
quoted as saying, "No one leaves the
deficiency list from my class. No
matter how good he does from here
in.' Seems hardly fair not to give a
man a fighting chance to get off "the
list."

Did anyone see Carter and his lat-
est creation—black scivvies? Seems
his brilliant idea of matching scivvy
and jumper wasn't too well receiv-
ed, though .

o 
A post-Yule note—There is nothing

presumptuous about the coeds of the
University of Kansas, but five sprigs
of mistletoe adorned the ceiling of
one of the women's dormitories dur- j
ing the holidays. It is sent each year,
in similar quantities , by an alumna
who still has the better interests of
Ihe hall at heart. —ACP.

Stanford 0 0-0 2
Baietti 10 2-4 22

Totals 27 13-19 G7
Bloomsburg 4 13 17 17—51
Muhlenburg 13 20 14 20—67

Reports from all the Seniors at
their ball and banquet last week in-
dicated that those who attended en-
joyed themselves immensely. Every
member from the chairman down to
those who rose early on Sunday
morning to lay the rug in the Eastern
Star Room made the two evenings
highlights for members of the Class
of 1944.

Re verses Win of Two Weeks Ago
When they cried "54-40 or fight"

just about a hundred years ago, they
had the right idea. At Bloomsburg,
it was "54-40 and what a fight." The
Huskies downed the Bucknell Bisons
by that score in a> beautiful exhibi-
tion of cooperation by the home
team, last Wednesday night. This
was sweet revenge for Chief Jack
Llewellyn's men, after a 5 point loss
at Bucknell two weeks ago.

At half time, evenly matched play-
ing brought the score to 24-22 in
Bloomsburg's favor. In the third
quarter Bloomsburg fell behind, 28-
29, but only for a few seconds. That
brief taste of victory was all the Bi-
sons wore rationed by the Huskies.
From then on in , the Teachers were
like a sailor headed home on "boot
leave"—noth ing could stop them.

Reel Graham and Ed. Vogelsong
were ball hawks that couldn 't be de-
n ied. The towering Bisons couldn 't
keep up with them. Bierly was a
"Flying Dutchman" to the Bucknell
squad. Ganly and Goepfert balanc-
ed oft' the smooth working five.

Graham rang up 16 points , with
Goepfert looping 15 points and Bierly
14.

Bucknell's high scorer was Lefkan-
dinos with 15. Hoeveler , Bloom's ne-
mesis in the Inst gome, was held to 12
points.

The last quarter showed Blooms-
burg gaining 14 points while holding
the Bisons to 6 points.

Huskies Defeat
Bucknell in Fierce

Contest , 54 to 40

teams in the East.
The date for the rendezvous with

the Olmstead Airbase has been set,
but there has been no official san-
ctioning of the proposed tussle. This
game would afford the fans another
opportunity to watch those coordinat-
ed Huskies in action against All-
American Sadowski. Let's keep our

.fingers crossed.

Miss Shirley Appleton, former sec-
retary of the Benjamin Franklin
Training School, has accepted a po-
sition with the War Department in
Newark, New Jersey. The vacancy
caused by Miss Appleton's resigna-
tion has been filled by Miss Lois Mc-
Daniels who was an attendant of the
Wilkes-Barre Business College and a
recent employee of the Union Produc-
tion Credit Association in Blooms-
burg.
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